
  Our Improvement Plan for 2021-2022 – A summary 
    Here are some of the things we will be trying to improve this year: 

Priority 1: Refreshing our vision, aims 

and pedagogy 
“We will develop a clear ethos around play-based 
learning and a positive and empowering vision of 
children that leads to a rich and nurturing learning 
environment.” 
 

• Clear and relevant statement of our vision for 
children’s education 

• Parent stay and plays, information sessions, 
social events and broader consultation 

• Improved nursery environment 

• Improved planning for learning 

• Nurturing principles clear to all 

• Improved professional reading and engagement 
for staff 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 

Priority 2: Improving our Health and 

Wellbeing curriculum 

“We will provide a curriculum for children, which will 
also impact upon families and staff, that promotes 
physical and mental health and promotes healthy 
habits for future life.” 
 

• Play on Pedals program continues 

• Promoting Alternative Thinking Strategies 
(PAThS) program continues 

• Use of local outdoors spaces and increasing 
outdoors play 

• Restart Childsmile toothbrushing 

• Physical activities for the whole family 

• Improved snack and baking area 

• Caring for nursery animals as part of curriculum 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Priority 3: Improving our support for 

Inclusion 
“We will improve targeted support for those children 
that need it, including methods of personalised 
assessment, planning, tracking and ensuring 
progress.” 
 

• Better Wellbeing Plans for children who need 
additional support, with more frequent review 
meetings with parents 

• Improved All About Me documents with targets 
for children’s progress 

• Improved home links to support children’s 
development, with more parent/carer 
involvement 

• Better tracking of children’s progress and regular 
reviews with parents 

• A focus on staff training and development to 
support additional needs 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 


